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System Requirement:

e Minimum Web browser specification Internet Explorer 8 (IE8)/ IE9 as
recommended

e Application : Java Installed
e Operating System (OS) : Min Windows XP

Setting Requirement:

e Activated Pop-up Block
e Activated Compatibility View Setting
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A . Setting activation Pop-up block by;

1. Go to Tool - Pop-up Blocker - Pop-up Blocker settings

Z7 http://appsourcing2.app.co.id:50000/irj/portal P+ & X || 7 SAP NetWeaver Portal

File Edit View Favorites elp

Delete browsing history... Ctrl+Shift+Del
1 InPrivate Browsing Ctrl+Shift+P

Tracking Protection...
ActiveX Filtering

Diagnose connection problems... SAP n W

Reopen last browsing session etWeaver
Add site to Start menu 4
View downloads Ctrl+) {

Pop-up Blocker Turn off Pop-up Blocker
SmartScreen Filter Pop-up Blocker settings

Password *

Manage add-ons

Compatibility View
Compatibility View settings

Log On

Subscribe to this feed...
Feed discovery »

Windows Update
F12 developer tools

HttpWatch Basic
Blog This in Windows Live Writer

Copyright ® SAP AG. Al Rights Reserved w

Internet options

2. Key-in *.app.co.id at address of website to allow, click Add and Close button

Exceptions

Pop-ups are cumently blocked. You can allow pop-ups from specific
websites by adding the site to the list below.

Address of website to allow:

*.app.co.id| F I Add |

Allowed sites: /
*.app.co.id “ [ Remove

Remove all..

Notifications and blocking level:

[7] Play a sound when a pop-up is blocked.
Show Notification bar when a pop-up is blocked.

Blocking level:
[High: Block all pop-ups {Cid+Alt to ovemide)

Leam more about Pop-up Blocker
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B. Setting Compatibility View by ;

1. Go to Tool - Compatibility View Setting

7 http://appsourcing2.app.co.id:50000/ir)/portal P ~ € X | =7 SAP NetWeaver Portal

File Edit View Favorites Help
Delete browsing history... Ctrl+Shift+Del
InPrivate Browsing Ctrl+Shift+P

racking Protection...

ctiveX Filtering

agnose connection problems...
SAP NetWeaver

Reopen last browsing session

site to Start menu

Viely downloads Ctrl+)

PopYup Blocker »

Smar{Screen Filter > User*
Manajle add-ons Password *

CompXibility View
Compatibility View settings I

Log On

Subscribe to this feed...
Feed discovery »
Windows Update

F12 developer tools

HttpWatch Basic
Blog This in Windows Live Writer

Copyright ® SAP AG. All Rights Reserved w

Internet options

Compatibility View Settir

l/_\}h You can add and remove websites to be displayed in
m Compatibility View.

Add this website:

F'l Add ||

[ ] Indude updated website lists from Microsoft
[V] Display intranet sites in Compatibility View
Display all websites in Compatibility View
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PROCEDURE

1. Open Browser Internet Explorer and Log on to http://appsourcing.app.co.id
2. Enter your SRM ID and password

@ APP SAP NetWeaver

uppller User ID* |
Password *

nelationship
Management

@ 2008 SAP AG. All rights reserved.

& _—

&

3. This is the main page inside the SRM system.

Normally the main page is Submit Bids & Auctions --> eRFxs Al

http://appsourcing2.app.co.id:50000/irj/ portal P ~ & X § =7 Bid Processing - SAP NetW... %

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help
Welcome Leo Personalize | SAPStore | Logoff w

Advanced Search

Bid Processing | Bid Prcessing

| History, Back Forward [Z]

Portal Favorites

Active Queries

I eRFxs All(195) Published 11)|Er\ded (0) Completed IO)IBMJ Invitations (1) I

All(0) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0) Auctions (0)

eRFxs - All
~ Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance

Eventhumber: O [ | L I 4
EventStaws: [~
Creation Date: < To 2
Deadine Date Flag: | |
saws: [ 7]
Response Tmeframe: [ ~]

| View: [[Standard View] ] | Create Response | Display Event Display Response | Print Preview | Refresh Exports &

T Event Nurmer| Event Description | EventType | Event Status | stmnm\ EndDate | Response Number | Response Status | Event Version | Response Version | Q8A | StartTime | End time
8100118580 | RAPUT 1111 Bid Invitation | Published 12112015 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 | 18:00:00
8100118678 | RAPUT .11.11 Bid Invitation | Published 12112015 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 | 18:00:00
810011863¢ | RAPUTF A10.11 Bid Invitation | Published 12.11.2015 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 | 18:00:00
8100118805 | DDAR-.109.11. Bid Invitation | Published 11112015 No Bid Created 0 00:00:00 | 15:00:00
8100118452 | DDART"105.11 Bid Invitation | Published 11112015 | 8500308 Accepted 0| 00:0000 | 14:00:00
8100118438 | RAPU™..A 0411 Bid Invitation | Published 121.2015 | 8500308: Submited 0| 00:0000 | 18:00:00
8100118437 RAPL ... .04.11 Bid Invitation | Published 12.11.2015 | 9500308€: : Submitted 0 00:00:00 13“0'%@

£

4. Enter BID number at Event Number field
5. Click Apply
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Active Queries

eRFxs All(195) Published (1) Ended (0) Completed (0) Bid Invitations (0)
eAuctions All(0) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0) Auctions (0)

eRFxs - Bid Invitations E

= [siooti7221] | To | ®

Event Number|
Event Status: S |
Creation Date: < [ia] To @J 4

Deadline Date Flag:

Status:

Response Timeframe:

View: |[Standard View] | Refresh B

rr_ﬁ‘ Event Number “ Event Description [ Event Type \ Event Status \ Start Date ‘ End Date } Response Number I Response Status | Event Version \ Response Version | Q8A | StartTime | End time D

6. BID number will appear if the submission deadline is active

Active Queries

eRFxs All(195) Published (1) Ended (0) Completed (0) Bid Invitations (1)
All(0) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0) Auctions (0)

€RFxs - Bid Invitations
~ Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance

Event Number: _l To : L4
Event Status: >
Creation Date: <
Deadline Date Flag: I:l
s [~
Response Timeframe: =

‘ View: | [Standard View] || & | D Print P | Refresh Exporta &
5] Event Number i Event Description \ Event Type | Event Status | Start Date | End Date ‘ Response Number = Response Status | g ‘ersion | Response Version \ Q&A | Start Time = End time
l 8100118680 RAPUTRA 11.11.2015 13:02:14 | Bid Invitation = Published 12.11.2015 No Bid Created 0 | 00:00:00  18:00:00

7. Next, click Event Number 8100118680 and a new window called Display RFx appear* and click
Participate button along with click Create Response button

Display RFx :

Print Preview |

| cio

and (0) Export -

RFx Number 8100118680 RFx Name RAPUTRA 11.11.2015 13:02:14 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 12.11.2015 18:00:00 UTC+7
Remaining Time 0 Days 01:00:24 RFxOwner MrRIO ] RFx Version Number RFx Version Type Active Version

' RFXInformation ] tems | Notes and Attachments |

l RFx Parameters | Questions | Note and Attachments

Time Zone: [UTC+7
Start Date: 00:00:00 PaTETorme,
* Submission Deadiine: |12.11.2015 18:00:00
Opening Date: [12.11.2015 18:01:00
End of Binding Period:
Currency: [USD
Incoterms (part 2):

Incoterms:

Add Se a Call Clear

Fiter Settings

| Function | number | Name
| | - Reauester Mr. R3 ADAPTER
| + Location Indah Kiat Pulp & Paper PRW

*note if not appear : please enable the pop-up blocker setting for this web site
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8. A new window Create RFx Response appear
9. On this display we start to fill all information such as :
A. RFx Information --> Basic Data --> fill Currency, terms of Payment and Incoterms

od |

Create RFx Response | History, Back Forward E‘]

Create RFx Response

Submit | Read Only PrintPreview | Check Close Save Export Import Questions and Answers(0) (2 P
n Line 0001: Std Lifetime is mandatory
/A Line 0001: Price must be filed ( item 1)

RFx Response Number 9500308748 RFx Number 8100118680 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12.11.2015 18:00:00 UTC+7
Opening Date 12.11.2015 18:01:00 UTC+7 Remaining Time 0 Days 00:56:55 RFx Owner Mr. RITO ALDINA PUTRA Total Value 0.00 USD
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number Active V

/"I ﬁlﬂonmﬁonl ttems f Notes and Attachments f Summary [ Tracking ‘

eters ’ Incoterm: | o[
Currency: |American Dollar v

Terms of Payment:

Status and Statistics
Created On: | 12.11.2015 17:03:05 UTC+7
Created By: | Mr. Leo Sukanto

Incoterms (location):
! 2 Last Processed On: | 12.11.2015 17:03:05 UTC+7

Preferred Incoterm:

Last Processed By: | Mr. Leo Sukanto

Preferred Pay. terms: ]

Payment Terms: |

)

Fitter Settings

| Function ‘ Number ‘ Name | Phone Number
| | - Location Indah Kiat Pulp & Paper PRW

B. RFx Information --> Question --> Fill all information
Delivery Time in Weeks [Number] : time you need to deliver the material/goods
Country of Origin : location where the material was produced/ manufactured
Price Validity Period : valid price with date format [dd.mm.yyyy]
Standard Lifetime :(time of shelf life materials) in number format and measurement of lifetime
(choose from dropdown list).
Warranty : (time of guarantee materials) in number format measurement of warranty (choose from
drop-down list).

|72 Create RFx Response -

Create RFx Response | History, Sack Forward [=]

Create RFx Response

Submit | Read Only PrintPreview | Check Close Save Export Import Questions and Answers (0) > P
@ Line 0001: Std Lifetime is mandatory
&2 Line 0001: Price must be filled ( item Ly,
RFx Response Number 9500308748 RFx Number 8100118680 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12.11.2015 18:00:00 UTC+7
Opening Date 12.11.2015 18:01:00 UTC+7 Remaining Time 0 Days 00:56:55 RFx Owner Mr. RITO ALDINA PUTRA Total Value 0.00 USD
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number Active V

ftems ‘ Notes and Attachments i' Summary f Tracking ‘

| Jiotes and Attachments

Basic Data

Question Reply Comment
~ Detvery Time in Weeks Number: [ o | ——
* Country of Origin: 5 i g
= Price Validity Period [0d.mm.yyyyl: 1 [—

Standard Lifetime [Number}: [ o]

Lifetime UoM [Choose: Days/Months/Years/Hours/-}: [ ~]
Warranty (Number:: [ 0]

Warranty UoM [ Choose: Days/Months/Years/Hours/ -1 [~
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Example :
R Inf tems lf Notes and Attachments " Summary f Tracking ‘

Question Reply

Delivery Time in Weeks [Number]: * [ 2]
Country of Origin: ™ (usa |
Price Yalidity Period [dd . mm . yyyy]: [31.122010 lca]
Standard Lifetime [Number]: | 12
Lifetime UoM [Choose: DaysMonths/YearsHours/ - | = M]

Warranty [Number] | 3
Warranty UoM [ Choose: DaysMorthsfYearsiHourss - | * [Morths |~

For chemical materials or others, if there are no lifetime and warranty, just enter ‘0’ zero number and
choose ‘-* by click the dropdown list.

Standard Lifetime [Number]: DI

Lifetime UoM [Choose: DaysMonths/YearsHourss - | *

|
Warranty [Number]: | 0|

Warranty UoM [ Choose: DaysMonths/YearsMHourss - | *

C. RFx Information --> Noted and attachments --> Bidder’s remarks or Add attachment
You can add additional information via text at Bidder’s remarks or click add attachment

Create RFx Response | History, Back Forward @
Create RFx Response 1
Submit | Read Only Print Preview | Check Close Save Export Import Questions and Answers (0) 0 4

ﬂ Attribute Country of Origin is mandatory; maintain attribute value

0 Attribute Delivery Time in Weeks [Number] is mandatory; maintain attribute value
0 Attribute Price Validity Period [dd.mm.yyyy] is mandatory; maintain attribute value
o Line 0001: Std Lifetime is mandatory

& Line 0001: Price must be filled ( item 1)

RFx Response Number 9500308743 RFx Number 8100118580 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12.11.2015 18:00:00 UTC+7

Opening Date 12.11.2015 18:01:00 UTC+7 Remaining Time 0 Days 00:46:59 RFx Owner Mr. RITO ALDINA PUTRA Total Value 0.00 USD
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number Active V

i 4 4 . Y
m tems k Notes and Attachments ‘/ Summary k Tracking |

Fitter Settings EI
|| Bid Invitation/Auction Pext
Bidder's Remarks I -Empty-
Purchaser's Remarks -Empty-
Add Attachment JEdit Description Versioning Delete Create Profile Fitter Settings ‘
‘ Category | Description File Name Version Processor Checked Out ‘ Type | Size (KB) Changed by Changed on \
@ The table does not contain any data
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-in Price at Price column or at item data (by click line number 0001

Create RFx Response | History, Back Forward [
Create RFx Response
Submit | Read Only Print Preview | Check Close Save Export Import Questions and Answers (0 ) 04
Line 0001: Price must be filled ( item 1)
RFx Response Number 9500308748 RFx Number 8100118680 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12.11.2015 18:00:00 UTC+7 Opening Date 12.11.2015 18:01:00 UTC+7
Remaining Time 0 Days 00:24:34 RFx Owner Mr. RITO ALDINA PUTRA Total Value 0.00 USD RFx Response Version Number Active Version
RFx Version Number Active V
/" Rexinformation M Notes and Attachments f Summary k Tracking l
~ - =
=
Details  Add New « | py Paste Delete | Calculate Value |
Line Number ‘ ltem Type ‘ Product ID ‘ Product Category I Product Category Description | Required Quantity | Subrriuednnanw hi I Price [ Currency | Price Per | De
. ﬁoom [E] | CONV.BELT;ABR,30W,1T,2P,50Kgf/cm2 Material 20612410 202000200 BELT,FLAT 100.000 100.000 M 0.00 JusD 1 On
E
£ B

You also can key-in Price at Items --> 0001 --> Item Data --> Price

Create RFx Response | History, Back Forward [Z]
Create RFx Response
Submit | Read Only PrintPreview | Check Close Save Export Import Questions and Answers (0) @4

A\ Line 0001: Price must be filed (tem 1)

RFx Response Number 9500308748 RFx Number 8100118680 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12.11.2015 18:00:00 UTC+7 Opening Date 12.11.2015 18:01:00 UTC+7 Remaining Time 0 Days 00:22:34
RFx Owner Mr. RITO ALDINA PUTRA Total Value 0.00 USD RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number Active V'

" RFxInformation Notes and Attachments. k Summary k Tracking ‘

Details Add New opy Paste Delete | Calculate Value

‘ Line Number cription ‘ IemType‘ Product D | Product Category ‘ Product Category Description | Required Quantty Subrrﬂ(eﬂommiy‘ u.m‘ Prlee‘ Ounency[ Price Per ‘ Delivery Date ‘rmvme [ RFx/Response
. @001 PONV.BELT.ABR 30W,1T2P SOKgficm2 Materisl 20612410 202000200 BELT FLAT 100,000 1000004 000 USD 1 0n09.012016 000 o 0

Identification Currency: [American Dollar ]
* Configurable ftem Number: (0001 T Required Quantty: | 100.000] M Meter
Control Key: Material functional antity: I Meter
temType: [Material | Price: 0.00 Pe [ 1M
Product Category: |303000200 | BELTFLAT
Product D: [20612410 ocation: [ [a]ll ] =
<l B

10. After completing all information above, go click check button to make sure all information are
complete and no errors before click submit button.
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Create RFx Response | History, Back Forward [=]
Create RFx Response
Submit | Read Only Print Preview l Check | Close Save Export Import Questions and Answers (0 ) °‘

| E RFx response is complete and contains no errors. I‘_

RFx Response Number 9500308748 RFx Number 8100118680 Status In Process Submission Deadline 12.11.2015 18:00:00 UTC+7 Opening Date 12.11.2015 18:01:00 UTC+7
Remaining Time 0 Days 00:05:24 RFxOwner Mr.RTO[ ]  Total Value [__Juso RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number Active V

4 y 2 y
’/ RFx Information m Notes and Attachments r Sumryf Track'ng‘

Detais AddNew . | Copy Faste Delete | Calculate Value

|l.‘mvaher [Dtscrwm ineml’ype| ProduaD[ProdndWry'Mdcategwymm Required Quantity Subwinedouamity| Unit| Pnee‘ Cunency[ PfieePer|DeiveryDete
[_| .« @JO001[E CONVBELTABR| | Materal 206120 202000200 BELT,FLAT 100.000 100.000 M 10.00 USD 1 0n09.01.2016
[« B

Final, click Submit button as your final confirmation

Creale RFx Response.

| Submit | |Read Only Print Preview | Check Close Save

RFx Response Number 9500308748 RFx Number 811
Remaining Time 0 Days 00:05:24 RFx Owner

10
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Additional Information :

1. If you are not sure and want to submit the quotation later, you can save your changes by using
Save button. Your document will be saved in Held status, and can be reprocessed later.

Remember, you can only submit your quotation before submission deadline.
After submitting your quotation, please wait for notification from Purchaser.

You will receive a notification when your quote is being Returned, Rejected or Accepted.
If Your Quote status is “Returned”, please follow below guide.

o o~ w0 Dd

18t Log in to SRM system using your SRM ID and password. find BID with Response Status is
Returned (see below snapshots)

EL  Event Number
8100042133

Event Description
SSUKIMIN 22.04.2010 15:22:51

Event Type
Bid Invitation

Event Status
Published

Start Date End Date

31.07.2010

Response Number
95001458520 -

Response !
Returned

7. Click the Respond Number (95001xxxx) not BID/Event number (81000xxxx)
Active Queries

eRFxs All(1) Published (0) Ended (110) Completed (6) Bid Invitations (1)
eAuctions All(1) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0) Auctions (0)

eRFxs - All

[~ Hide Quick Criteria Maint e |

Event Number: = (8100003685 | ol ] @
Event Status: >
Creation Date: < To =
Deadline Date Flag: I:
Status: [ ~]
Response Timeframe: E
‘ View: |[Standard View] v| | Create Response | Display Event Display Response | Prin | Refresh Export4
’l'[j‘ Event Number ﬂ Event Description ‘ Event Type | Event Status | StartDate | End Dat Response Number | Response Status | Event Version |

ij 8100003685 PURTJ008 03.08.2015 11:05:39 | Bid Invitation | Published 14.11.2015 | 9500005337 Returned

Response I History,  Sach 5 =1
Display RFx Response:
Print Preview | % | Check Ciose == Do Mot i T Export Q =T co) & -
RFx Response mber a1 Status Returned Submission Deadline 14.11.2015 18:15:00 JAPAN
Opening Dales, 14.11.2015 18:15:30 IAPAN Remaining Time 1 Days 21:40:48 RFx Owner Purchaser
Total Value 5,000,200 DR REx Version Active Version RFx Version Number Active V
. RFx Information f rems Notes and Attachments | Summary - Tracking
| Basicpata | aQuestions | Notes and Attachments |
Event Parameters Service and Detlivery =
Currency: [Indonesian Rupiah Incoterm: |[FRC Tanjung Priok
Terms of Payment: | NO30 Due net 30 days e e ettt
Created On: [03.08.2015 13:09:00 JAPAN
Incoteape (locsion ). Created By: [Mr. supplier06 supplieros
FrafesedSicotenn Last Processed On: [04.09.2015 18:14:10 JAPAN
Last Processed By: |Purchaser
Preferred Pay. terms:
Payment Terms:
~ Partners and Delivery Information =1
T = = Filter Settings
Function Number Name | Phone Number =
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